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PROPOSAL NUMBER: 18-102-SP-R1

DATE OF PROPOSAL: May 9, 2018 DATE PROPOSAL EXPIRES: July 9, 2018

PURAFIL EMERGENCY GAS SCRUBBER MEDIA REPLACEMENT FOR THREE RIVERS FILTRATION PLANT
FORT WAYNE, IN — THREE RIVERS FILTRATION PLANT (H97-0793.EGS)

PURAFIL CHLOROSORB ULTRA MEDIA
2.41 Safety Factor for 1-ton oversized 2,350 Ih. chlorine cylinder

37,800 lbs. media (840 cu. ft.) shipped in 21 slingbags

EGS media replacement for one FOC1 unit:
Total Price
Price: 590,720 USD

OPTIONS
Freight: $2,000 USD
Installation and removal/disposal of spent media: $7,000 USD

STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS APPLY BELOW
TERMS: 100% in 30 days after delivery

LEAD TIME: Stock subject to availability; 0-3 weelks after P.O.

NOT INCLUDED: Taxes

CONTACT: Sabrina Phillips, Ph.D.
Customer Solutions Applications Specialist
Purafil, Filtration Group
2654 Weaver Way

Doraville, GA 30340 U.S.A, !
Office: +1 770.825.7303 g C‘C\ \-;"ZO

Puralil, Inc. 2654 Weaver Way, Doraville, Georgia, 30340 U.S.A. Phone: +1 770 662 8545 Fax: +1 770 263 6922 www.purafil.com
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March 12, 2018

Mike Gierscher
Brandy Lampkins
1100 Griswold Dr.
Fort Wayne, IN 46805

Dear Mr. Gierscher and Ms. Lampkins,

Purafil Inc. is the sole manufacturer and provider for Purafil’'s chemical filtration media for the municipal market
in Indiana, which includes the City of Fort Wayne; this includes all water and waste water treatment facilities.

Purafil Chlorosorb Ultra, Purafil Chlorosorb 2, and Purafil Chlorosorb media are specially engineered for the
Purafil emergency gas scrubber D03-4990 at the City of Fort Wayne's wastewater facility.

Purafil’s proprietary Chlorosorb Ultra and Chlorosorb 2 Media is exclusively protected by U.S. Patent No.
8182775 and U.S. Patent No. 856502. '

Please let us know if you require additional information.

Sabrina Phillips, Ph.D.

Customer Solutions Applications Specialist
Purafil, Filtration Group

2654 Weaver Way

Doraville, GA 30340 U.S.A.

Office: +1 770.825.7303

Puralil, Inc. 2654 Weaver Way, Doraville, Georgia, 30340 U.S.A. Phone: +1 770 662 8545 Fax: +1 770 263 6922 www .purafil.cormn
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CONTRIBUTION STATEMENT BY A BUSINESS ENTITY

Jonathon Calhoun , under the penalties of perjury, affirm and state

as follows

1.

2.

5/15/2018
Date

| am over the age of eighteen (18) years old.

| am an officer or party of the below named company/firm, a business entity
within the meaning of Section 37.28 of the Fort Wayne Municipal Code of
Ordinances (the “City Code").

As an officer or party of the below named company/firm, | am authorized to
execute this Contribution Statement by a Business Entity on behalf of said
business entity.

Since January 1, 2018, neither the below named company/firm, nor any of its
covered principals, partners, officers, subsidiaries, or other individuals as
defined in Section 37.28 has made a contribution to any City of Fort Wayne
candidate or holder of public office, whether directly or indirectly by
contribution to such candidate’s or holder of public office’s campaign
committee, a City or Allen County party committee or a political action
committee that regutarly engages in the support of municipal elections and/or
municipal parties in the City of Fort Wayne, which would prohibit the City of
Fort Wayne from negotiating or entering into a contract with the below named
company/firm under Section 37.28 of the City Code.

This Contribution Statement by a Business Entity is made pursuant to Section
37.28 of the City Code to support approval of a contract between the City of
Fort Wayne, indiana and the below named company/firm.

Purafil
Company/Firm

e

Printed: _Jonathon Calhoun

By:

Title: Director of Customer Solutions




Karen M. Salge

From: Ericka Wallace

Sent: Tuesday, May 15, 2018 12:18 PM
To: Karen M. Salge

Cc: Mike Gierscher; John Clark
Subject: FW: Chlorine gas scrubber media
Attachments: 20180515120516555.pdf

Karen - can you please prepare the BOW paperwork for this? We are purchasing and replacing the media in
the Filtration Plant's chlorine gas scrubber.

Project is #66788 (5276RFEV4-5471N5)

Total cost $99,720

| have attached the quote and the sole source letter. If you need anything else, let me know.

Ericka Wallace, CET
260-427-2401

From: flpprinter

Sent: Tuesday, May 15, 2018 12:05 PM

To: Ericka Wallace

Subject: Message from "RNP00267337C3F2"

This E-mail was sent from "RNP00267337C3F2" (Aficio MP C3501).

Scan Date: 05.15.2018 12:05:16 (-0400)
Queries to: flpprinter@acfwad.acfw.in.us




